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                                                            BID TABULATION 
 

Bid Number/RFP                  Description Department 
 

2012-451-1 
                

 Janitorial Supplies & Equipment 
 

Building Maintenance 
I.  CLEANING TOOLS 

 

 
Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est. 
Qty. 

Miller 
Paper 

Amarillo 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Amarillo 

Office 
Wise 

Amarillo 

Empire 
Paper 

Wichita 
Falls 

Wagner 
Lubbock 

Central 
Polycorp 

New 
Jersey 

All Star 
Amarillo 

  DELIVERY:   Mon-Fri 
delivery 

in 
Amarillo,

Friday 
only 

Canyon 

Mon-Fri 
delivery in 
Amarillo 
Thursday 

only 
Canyon 

Monday –
Friday 

Amarillo/
Canyon 

Friday’s 
(but can 

change to 
another 

day of the 
week) 

Next day 
delivery if 

ordered 
before 
3:00pm 

7-10days 
ARO by 
freight 
only 

Next day 
delivery if 

ordered 
before 
4:30 

 1 20 in. Black Stripping Pad – 
5/case Case 5 20.91 15.99 34.08 12.50 16.30 No Bid 38.73

 2 20 in. UHS Hogs Hair 
Buffing Pad 5/case Case 5 21.62 15.99 No Bid 12.50 17.18 No Bid No Bid

 3 20 in. White Polishing Pad – 
5/case Case 20 20.54 15.99 33.13 12.50 16.30 No Bid 38.73
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Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est. 
Qty. 

Miller 
Paper 

Amarillo 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Amarillo 

Office 
Wise 

Amarillo 

Empire 
Paper 

Wichita 
Falls 

Wagner 
Lubbock 

Central 
Polycorp 

New 
Jersey 

All Star 
Amarillo 

 4 20” Aqua High Speed 
Burnishing Pads 5/case Case 15 48.20 15.99 40.10 12.50 14.50

No Bid 
38.73

 5 16 oz. Rayon Fantail  Mop 
Head – 12/case Case 3 50.61 44.62 70.40 52.52 34.35

No Bid 
No Bid

 6 24 oz ¼” Head Band Rayon 
Mop Head – 12/case Case 20 51.35 40.72 108.12 75.36 37.90

No Bid 
88.37

 7 54 in. Quick Change  Mop 
Handle Each 48 7.04 6.93 10.30 8.43 5.15

No Bid 
8.93

 8 Big Jaw Fiberglass Mop 
Handle  Each 18 8.60 7.72 16.75 10.77 10.95

No Bid 
10.98

 9 Feather Dusters Each 10 6.83 8.78 5.44 6.50 6.20 No Bid 2.52

 10 Rubbermaid 35 qt. Mop 
Bucket w/ 3 in. casters & 
wringer – yellow Each 2 56.43 59.89 70.86 41.75 54.05

No Bid 

84.74

 11 Toilet Bowl Mop 100/case 
Case 2 .84 .86  

.79  
(25ea/cs) 

.71  
71.00/cs

.66  
65.90/cs

No Bid 
.75

 12 32 oz. Bottle for Trigger 
Sprayer Each 150 .86 .71 .65 .66 .48

No Bid 
.58

 13 Trigger Sprayer 9 7/8” Each 225 .66 .65 .54 .51 .31 No Bid .56

 14 5 in. x 36 in. Cotton- Dust 
Mop Heads Each 12 9.91 7.44 9.22 13.65 5.05

No Bid 
7.45

 15 24 in. x 3.5 in. Cotton-Dust 
Mop Head Each 12 7.13 5.31 No Bid 10.53 No Bid

 
No Bid 6.09
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Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est. 
Qty. 

Miller 
Paper 

Amarillo 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Amarillo 

Office 
Wise 

Amarillo 

Empire 
Paper 

Wichita 
Falls 

Wagner 
Lubbock 

Central 
Polycorp 

New 
Jersey 

All Star 
Amarillo 

 16 Broom-Large Angler Plastic Each 78 5.71 6.96 6.94 4.10 4.75 No Bid 7.25

 17 Broom-Whisk Each 12 2.74 4.96 No Bid No Bid 2.10 No Bid No Bid

 18 60” Metal Threaded Wood 
Handle  Each 12 2.76 4.13 4.82 7.90 2.59 No Bid 4.70

 19 Green Scrubbing Pads-
Medium 6x9 10/bx  6bx/cs 

Case
/60 24 17.85 19.53 ? 16.41 17.99 No Bid 15.72

 
 

II.  TRASH DISPOSAL PRODUCTS 
***Successful Bidder will be required to supply Randall County with a sample of each liner before award will be made.  Randall County will act as sole judge in determining compliance with 

specifications and acceptability of products offered.  
 

 
Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est. 
Qty. 

Miller 
Paper 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Office 
Wise 

Empire 
Paper Wagner 

Central 
Polycorp 

All Star 
 

 1 24 x 24 – High Density – 8 
micron Plastic Liners – 
1000/case 7-10gal Case 30 20.88 46.00 13.97 14.80 11.40 41.42

  *Alternate – 6 micron   12.76 12.54 14.36 

 2 24 x 33 – High Density – 8 
micron Clear  Medium 
Plastic Liners 1M/cs Case 30 23.80 23.12 62.68 19.31 20.45 15.90 57.68

  *Alternate – 6 micron   19.75 

 3 33 x 40 – High Density – 16 
micron Plastic Liners – 33 
gal 250/cs Case 150 17.15 17.20 20.03 15.29 16.20 14.30 33.47
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Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est. 
Qty. 

Miller 
Paper 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Office 
Wise 

Empire 
Paper Wagner 

Central 
Polycorp 

All Star 
 

 4 43 x 48 High Density – 22 
micron Plastic Liners – 
150/cs Case 160 25.68 21.41 25.24 18.59 25.60 17.20 62.45

 5 Spectrum Dust Bags w/ 
Filters 10/pack  Pack 20 13.96 18.97 No Bid No Bid 15.55 No Bid No Bid

 6 Clarke Vacuum Bags 
#50721B 10/pack Pack 3 12.55 16.38 No Bid No Bid 15.55 No Bid No Bid

 
 

III.  HYGIENE PRODUCTS 
 

 
Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est. 
Qty. 

Miller 
Paper 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Office 
Wise 

Empire 
Paper Wagner 

Central 
Polycorp 

All Star 
 

 1 #4-147 Stayfree Maxi Pad, 
Feminine Napkins, Flat, 
250/case – size:  8.5 in. x 
2.75 in. x 5 in. Case 1 52.69 39.74 40.44 29.18 40.65 39.60 38.12

 2 Playtex, Regular Tampon, 
500/case – size:  4.75 in. x .5 
in. Case 1 100.03 75.28 70.43 61.00 63.75 69.97 65.75

 3 Waxed Bags for Sanitary 
Receptacle #  RCP6141  
250/cs  Case 5 33.08 25.21 33.75 14.87 19.95 24.30 20.31
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IV.  EXAMINATION GLOVES 
 

 
Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est. 
Qty. 

Miller 
Paper 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Office 
Wise 

Empire 
Paper Wagner 

Central 
Polycorp 

All Star 
 

 1 Synthetic Examination 
Gloves, 10 box/case, 
100/box, 1000/case 

  
*Box of 

100  $5.59 
*per bx 

7.32
       Size:  Small Case 1 41.70 40.37 55.90 39.03 41.30 75.50 73.20
       Size:  Medium Case 1 41.70 40.37 55.90 39.03 41.30 75.60 73.20
       Size:  Large Case 1 41.70 40.37 55.90 39.03 41.30 75.70 73.20
       Size:  X-Large Case 1 41.70 40.37 55.90 39.03 41.30 75.80 73.20
 2 Powder Free Latex Gloves, 

10 box/case, 100/box, 
1000/case 

  
*Box of 

100 $8.33 
*per box 

$9.39
       Size:  Small Case 1 62.69 59.97 83.30 61.92 37.25 45.50 93.90
       Size:  Medium Case 1 62.69 59.97 83.30 61.92 37.25 45.60 93.90
       Size:  Large Case 1 62.69 59.97 83.30 61.92 37.25 45.70 93.90
       Size:  X-Large Case 1 62.69 59.97 83.30 61.92 37.25 45.80 93.90
 3 Flocked Lined Rubber 

Gloves 
  

 
       Size:  Small Dozen 1 8.75 11.99 No Bid No Bid 11.10 9.00 No Bid
       Size:  Medium Dozen 2 8.75 11.99 No Bid 7.48 11.10 9.10 No Bid
       Size:  Large Dozen 2 8.75 11.99 12.33 7.48 11.10 9.20 10.97
       Size:  X-Large Dozen 1 8.75 11.99 No Bid No Bid 11.10 9.30 No Bid
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V.  PAPER PRODUCTS 
ITEMS IN BOLD MUST BE SPECIFIC BRAND TO FIT EXISTING DISPENSERS 

 

 
Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est. 
Qty. 

Miller 
Paper 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Office 
Wise 

Empire 
Paper Wagner 

Central 
Polycorp 

All Star 
 

 1 8 oz. Styrofoam Cups, 
1000/case Case 5 19.69 17.64 18.05 17.00 18.75 No Bid 20.70

 2 12 oz. Styrofoam Cups, 
1000/case Case 10 27.93 25.02 25.56 23.81 25.50 No Bid 40.44

 3 16 oz. Styrofoam Cups 
1000/case Case 20 34.63 36.15 33.11 34.42 36.70 No Bid 41.04

 4 BayWest 61990 EcoSoft 2-
ply Toilet Tissue 
36rl/865’roll Case 10 No Bid 44.98 No Bid 34.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid

 5 Bay West #6390 Dublsoft 
Optiserv Toilet Tissue 
36/800sht Case 40 No Bid 49.96 No Bid 34.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid

 6 Enmotion Towel Touchless 
6/800’rl/cs  Georgia Pacific 
only Case 30 56.70 59.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid 51.66 No Bid

 7 Toilet Tissue, 2-ply, 500 
sheets, 96 rolls/case, sheet 
size 4.5 in. x 4.5 in. 
(for jail use)  Case 450 36.99 33.59 35.67 33.67 34.50 54.66 43.25

 8 Cottonelle  2-ply Bathroom 
Tissue, 60rls/case Case 30 47.95 36.37 51.40 46.73 41.10 No Bid 49.32

 9 Kleenex Facial Tissue 2-ply 
100/bx  36bx/case Case 25 38.81 32.11 14.39 18.48 37.65 No Bid 46.45

   Alternate    18.15
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Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est. 
Qty. 

Miller 
Paper 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Office 
Wise 

Empire 
Paper Wagner 

Central 
Polycorp 

All Star 
 

 10 Multi-Fold Towel, 9 in. x 9.5 
in., white Dublsoft 3000/case Case 90 21.84 20.19 20.73 19.56 19.55 24.66 31.20

   Alternate   26.92  

 11 Kitchen Roll Towel, White 
11 in. x  9.375 in. 30rls/case Case 20 25.38 23.40 16.25 21.74 22.25 27.66 25.33

 12 Roll Paper Hand Towels 
835N       8 in x 350 ft  
12rls/cs  Case 102 20.87 19.69 27.51 18.48 18.90 18.66 24.90

 13 Brawny 21500 Wet Shop 
Towel 6pails/case Case 6 56.45 50.96 No Bid 50.00 54.15 No Bid 53.33

 14 Toilet Seat Covers, 5000/case 
(Dispenser: HG-5000) Case 2 67.79 28.66 57.39 42.14 44.95 33.66 33.20

 
 
 

VI.  CLEANING PRODUCTS AND CHEMICALS 
 

 
Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est. 
Qty. 

Miller 
Paper 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Office 
Wise 

Empire 
Paper Wagner 

Central 
Polycorp 

All Star 
 

 1 96 oz. Bleach – 6%, 4/case Case 20 7.27 11.99 8.91 8.65 14.55 No Bid 16.99

 2 Episan Plus Extra Care 
Sanitizing Gel w/ 
conditioner 8/ltr/cs Case 7 86.50 82.63 No Bid 67.40 60.09 No Bid No Bid

 3 Aerogreen Foam Soap 8/1-
ltr/cs Case 80 54.14 50.57 No Bid 35.17 49.85 No Bid No Bid

 4 Episan Plus Instant Sanitizer Gallon 48 84.49 64.99 No Bid 67.40 86.86 No Bid No Bid
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Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est. 
Qty. 

Miller 
Paper 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Office 
Wise 

Empire 
Paper Wagner 

Central 
Polycorp 

All Star 
 

w/Alcohol 8/ltr/cs 

 5 Crew 9.25% HCL Clinging 
Disinf. Acid Bowl & 
Porcelain Clnr 12qt/cs Case 36 33.26 23.26 39.51 19.73 25.95 No Bid 36.76

 6 Arm & Hammer Rug & 
Carpet Freshner 9/cs Case 2 43.33 30.07 47.25 28.41 38.15 No Bid 4.53

 7 Clorox Wipes 12/cs Fresh 
Scent Case 6 35.80 39.93 23.43 26.61 38.85 No Bid 31.94

 8 Pine Sol 3/144oz/cs Case 2 32.04 30.09 27.43 22.25 27.20 No Bid 25.89

 9 Comet Cleanser 21oz 
powder 24/cs Case 5 42.41 23.81 41.39 31.34 33.95 No Bid 35.33

 10 Cleaner Bathroom Vanisol 
HD 23% Acid 32oz 12/cs Case 12 47.20 41.39 28.37 21.08 21.15 No Bid 40.58

 11 Clean Breeze Deodorant 
Lemon Concentrate 4gl/cs Case 8 102.50 53.95 No Bid 42.40 30.00 No Bid 84.06

 12 UHS Kleen & Burnish 
Revive Plus 6/cs Case 42 106.14 77.77 No Bid 41.17 57.35 No Bid No Bid

 13 Over & Under Plus 
Undercover Sealer 4/1gl/cs Case 11 79.48 53.29 No Bid 46.53 56.10 No Bid 59.21

 14 Enseel Acrylic Sealer and 
Undercoat/4166 Over/Under 
4/1gl/cs Case 8 52.18 53.29 No Bid 45.14 56.10 No Bid No Bid

 15 Pop & Shine Gloss Restorer, 
Accumix, 6/cs Case 6 87.12 77.77 No Bid 41.29 57.35 No Bid No Bid

 16 Bare Bones Liquifying Case 12 59.04 39.59 No Bid 26.19 66.98 No Bid No Bid
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Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est. 
Qty. 

Miller 
Paper 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Office 
Wise 

Empire 
Paper Wagner 

Central 
Polycorp 

All Star 
 

Stripper 4/1gl/cs 

 17 Dust Cloth and Mop 
Treatment, Water-Based, 
aerosol 12/cs Case 1 64.35 47.54 57.60 22.87 35.50 No Bid 27.96

 18 Blue Wave, Ultra Blue Dish 
Soap 4x1gl/cs Case 2 29.00 37.84 59.66 19.48 39.60 No Bid No Bid

 19 SSS Metal Cleaner & Polish 
aerosol, oil based 15oz 12/cs Case 12 51.48 55.62 64.32 32.58 43.65 No Bid 56.30

 20 SSS Disposable Commode 
Floor Mat 6/cs Case 12 37.02 39.56 53.77 35.47 41.89 No Bid 40.41

 21 Stainless Steel Wipes 30ct 
6/cs Case 13 53.60 55.76 55.08 56.53 91.00 No Bid 35.11

 22 #57006 Scrubs in Bucket 
6/cs Case 19 71.54 50.96 62.89 54.11 55.55 No Bid 24.91

 
VII.  ODOR CONTROL PRODUCTS 

 

 
Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est. 
Qty. 

Miller 
Paper 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Office 
Wise 

Empire 
Paper Wagner 

Central 
Polycorp 

All Star 
 

 1 Timemist Classic aerosol 
dispenser or equal – 
chemical resistant plastic 
cabinet automatically 
activates metered refill every 
15 minutes, 24 hours a day, 
for 30 days – battery 
operated Ea 2 32.15 22.99 24.02 25.88 21.10 No Bid 26.08
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Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est. 
Qty. 

Miller 
Paper 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Office 
Wise 

Empire 
Paper Wagner 

Central 
Polycorp 

All Star 
 

 2 Timemist Classic aerosol 
refill Ea 80 3.74 2.99 3.41 2.73 2.70 No Bid 3.88

 3 03901 Urinal Screens 
12 per Box  12 boxes/case DZ 3 10.32 10.38 7.21 7.71 10.20 No Bid 10.09

 4 G5P-6043 Urinal Screens 
w/Cakes DZ 3 15.44 20.79 18.76 15.00 18.75 No Bid 13.26

 
 
 

VIII. DISPENSING SYSTEMS 
 
***Successful Bidder will be required to supply Randall County with all necessary dispensing equipment at no additional charge to Randall County.  Vendor is expected to own the equipment and be 
responsible for maintaining the equipment and all costs associated with that.  Randall County will act as sole judge in determining compliance with specifications and acceptability of products offered. 
This section will be awarded as an “all or none” to one vendor.   
 

 
Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est 
Qty Miller Paper

Mayfield 
Paper 

Office 
Wise 

Empire 
Paper Wagner 

Central 
Polycor

p 
All Star 

 
     Daley 

Cs/2/2ltr
Daley 

Cs/2/2ltr No Bid
Betco 

4/2ltr/cs
Hilyard 
4/1gl/cs No bid

Diversey 
Cs/2-1.4ltr 

 1 APM #1 Triumph All Purpose 
Neutral Cleaner, Neutral 
2/2ltr/cs Dilution 1:300 Case 19 29.27 26.99 No Bid 84.99 126.55 No Bid 86.49 

  How many RTU (ready to 
use) quarts per case? _____ 

RTU/
qt. 

Price 

 
1269qt/cs 1269qt/cs 

8656qt/cs
1:1024 

4096qt/cs 
1:256 

1109.5qt/cs  
1:375 

.0231 qt .0213 qt N/A .0098 qt .0309 qt N/A .0779 qt 

 2 APM #2 Blue Eyes Glass 
Cleaner 2/2ltr/cs Dilution 
1:32 Case 58 34.49 33.36 No Bid 75.10 92.00 No Bid 35.81 
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Item 

 
Description 

 
Unit 

Est 
Qty Miller Paper

Mayfield 
Paper 

Office 
Wise 

Empire 
Paper Wagner 

Central 
Polycor

p 
All Star 

 
  How many RTU (ready to 

use) quarts per case? _____ 
RTU/

qt. 
Price 

 
135.36qt/cs 135.36qt/cs

541 
1:64 dil.

320
1:20 dil 94.68qt/cs 

.2548 qt .2465 qt N/A .1388 qt .2875 N/A .3782 qt 

 3 APM #22 Bac Away 
Bathroom Cleaner, Non-Acid, 
2/2ltr/cs Dilution 1:32 Case 111 29.27 28.36 No Bid 78.37 71.00 No Bid 103.02 

  How many RTU (ready to 
use) quarts per case? _____ 

RTU/
qt. 

Price 

 
135.36qt/cs 135.36qt/cs

541qt/cs
1:64 dil

1024qt/cs
1:64 dil 94.68qt/cs 

.2162 qt .2095 qt N/A .1449 qt .0693 qt N/A

 
.3782 qt 

 

 4 APM #7 Altima 256 
Germicidal Detergent & 
Deod. Cleaner, Quat. 2/2ltr/cs Case 59 40.01 38.66 No Bid 73.61 111.25 No Bid 45.20 

  How many RTU (ready to 
use) quarts per case? _____ 

RTU/
qt. 

Price 

 1083qt/cs 1083qt/cs 2163qt/cs 3072qt/cs 757.43qt/cs 

.0369 qt .0357 qt N/A .0340 qt .0362 qt N/A .0597 qt 
 
 
 
 

Item Description Miller 
Paper 

Mayfield 
Paper 

Office 
Wise 

Empire 
Paper Wagner 

Central 
Polycorp All Star 

 1. For all other items list discount off catalog pricing 12% 25% 5-35% 30% 30% 5% 0% 
 


